
SAVE HARMLESS AND
INDEMNITY AGREEMENTOLD OAK

RANCH

EST 1947

To the fullest extent allowed by the law, we, the undersigned, hereby 
agree to release, defend, indemnify and hold harmless the International 
Church of the Foursquare Gospel and Old Oak Ranch Conference Center, 
it’s directors, employees, ministers, and agents from loss, claims of loss, 
costs, fees, and expenses, including costs, and attorney’s fees, arising 
from, alleged to arise from, or in connection with use of or in connection 
with the use of this equipment.

We understand that any and all liability for damage, injury or death to the 
undersigned, or to any other person or property which may result from 
using this equipment and we, freely and voluntarily, assume those risks, 
and we waive any right to present any claim or suit against these persons, 
whether based on the sole negligence of Old Oak Ranch or the 
parties stated above, breach of warranty, strict products liability or any 
other legal theories. We further understand that these types of activities 
including but not limited to: archery, tomahawk, ropes course events, 
swimming pools, game room, hiking, fishing, sports, paintball, BB Guns, 
and inflatables are HAZARDOUS activities which present risks of injury or 
death and we, freely and voluntarily, assume those risks.

PARENT/GUARDIAN ACTIVITY APPROVAL

_________________
Date

_________________________________
Child Name (Please Print)

_________________________________________________________ 
Parent/Guardian Name (Please Print)

_________________________________________________________ 
Signature

_________________________________________________________ 
Phone Number

We have carefully considered the risk involved and give consent for my 
child to participate in the activity. I understand that participation in the 
activity is entirely voluntary and requires participants to abide by applica-
ble rules and standards of conduct:

Without Restrictions:
With Restrictions: ______________________________________

_________________________________________________________ 
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